

**GENERAL CONTRACT BIDS**

Company:		Boro Construction	CMC, Inc.	E.R. Stuebner	IMC Construction	Lobar, Inc	McCarty & Son, Inc.	Penn Builders, Inc.	Perrotto Builders, Ltd.	Skepton Construction, Inc.		
Base Bid:		<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$15,381,000.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$15,777,000.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$16,850,000.00</b>	<b>\$16,381,000.00</b>	<b>\$15,625,000.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>
Incl. ?	Alt.#	Alternate Description:										
n	#			\$115,000.00		\$144,000.00		\$142,000.00	\$143,000.00	\$134,000.00		
n	#			\$40,000.00		\$46,000.00		\$42,000.00	\$32,000.00	\$38,000.00		
n	#			(\$151,000.00)		(\$116,000.00)		(\$158,000.00)	(\$127,000.00)	(\$145,000.00)		
n	#			(\$265,000.00)		(\$215,000.00)		(\$287,000.00)	(\$217,000.00)	(\$257,000.00)		
n	#			(\$110,000.00)		(\$127,000.00)		(\$112,000.00)	(\$105,000.00)	(\$120,000.00)		
n	#			(\$115,000.00)		(\$160,000.00)		(\$146,000.00)	(\$113,000.00)	(\$155,000.00)		
n	#			(\$41,000.00)		(\$42,000.00)		(\$37,000.00)	(\$40,000.00)	(\$40,000.00)		
n	#			(\$17,000.00)		(\$9,000.00)		(\$22,500.00)	\$8,000.00	\$8,000.00		
n	#			(\$75,000.00)		(\$68,000.00)		(\$62,000.00)	(\$73,000.00)	(\$70,000.00)		
n	#			(\$12,000.00)		(\$10,000.00)		(\$10,000.00)	(\$8,000.00)	(\$12,000.00)		
n	#			(\$5,000.00)		(\$40,000.00)		(\$5,000.00)	(\$200,000.00)			
n	#			\$8,000.00		\$4,000.00		(\$1,500.00)	\$3,000.00	\$3,500.00		
n	#			\$90,000.00		\$35,000.00		\$15,000.00	\$105,000.00	\$25,000.00		
n	#			\$75,000.00		\$150,000.00		\$250,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$40,000.00		
n	#									(\$2,000.00)		
n	#									(\$2,000.00)		
n	#									\$4,000.00		
n	#									\$2,000.00		
n	#									(\$2,000.00)		
y - Denotes chosen alternates												
<b>BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES:</b>		<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$15,381,000.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$15,777,000.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$16,850,000.00</b>	<b>\$16,381,000.00</b>	<b>\$15,625,000.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>

\$ ABOVE LOW BID WITH CHOSEN ALTERNATES:

			\$0.00		\$396,000.00		\$1,469,000.00	\$1,000,000.00	\$244,000.00			
	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0

**MECHANICAL CONTRACT BIDS**

New

Company:		Allstates Mechanical, Ltd.	Clipper Pipe and Service, Inc	Dolan Mechanical, Inc	Five Star Mechanical	Frey Lutz	Gaudelli Bros. Inc. Mechanical Contractors	Guy M. Cooper, Inc.	JBM Mechanical, Inc	Myco Mechanical, Inc.	North Bay Mechanical, LLC	Trefz Mechanical, Inc.	Tri-County Mechanical, Inc.	Allstate	Boro
Base Bid:		NO BID	4630000	4591000	3834000	NO BID	4682000	3995000	3722000	3983000	3850000	3427867	3865000	4199000	4125000
Incl.?	Alt.#	Alternate Description:													
n	#	No.1 : add classroom casework													
n	#	No.2: add classroom wall casework													
n	#		(\$20,185.00)	(\$38,800.00)	(\$18,000.00)		(\$26,200.00)	(\$8,000.00)	(\$23,000.00)	(\$32,000.00)	(\$15,700.00)	(\$26,636.00)	(\$20,000.00)	(\$24,178.00)	(\$34,000.00)
n	#		(\$40,370.00)	(\$69,700.00)	(\$32,000.00)		(\$63,200.00)	(\$24,000.00)	(\$40,000.00)	(\$59,000.00)	(\$25,800.00)	(\$45,697.00)	(\$25,000.00)	(\$43,428.00)	(\$60,000.00)
n	#	No.5A: Quartz tile in lieu Terr(2nd flr Corr)													
n	#	No.5B: Quartz tile in lieu Terr(1st flr Corr)													
n	#	No.5C:Quartz tile in lieu of Terr(café)													
n	#	No.6A:LVT in lieu of Quartz tile													
n	#	No.6B: VCT in lieu of Quartz tile													
n	#	No.7:Linear mtl clg in lieu Acoust baffles													
n	#	No.8:EPDM Roofing													
n	#	No.9:Resinous flooring in lieu ceramic													
n	#	No.10:unclassified site work													
n	#	No.11: fill within 5' (2A modified)													
n	#		\$42,000.00	\$25,000.00			\$120,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$200,000.00					\$55,000.00
n	#		\$32,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$27,000.00		\$91,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$200,000.00	\$113,500.00	\$59,750.00	\$27,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$40,000.00
n	#	No.14: Lighting Protection													
n	#	No.15: Distributed Antenna System													
n	#			\$49,000.00			\$44,000.00		\$45,000.00	\$42,000.00	\$47,300.00	\$39,977.00	\$48,000.00		
	y	Denotes chosen alternates													
<b>BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES:</b>		<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$4,630,000.00</b>	<b>\$4,591,000.00</b>	<b>\$3,834,000.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$4,682,000.00</b>	<b>\$3,995,000.00</b>	<b>\$3,722,000.00</b>	<b>\$3,983,000.00</b>	<b>\$3,850,000.00</b>	<b>\$3,427,867.00</b>	<b>\$3,865,000.00</b>	<b>\$4,199,000.00</b>	<b>\$4,125,000.00</b>

\$ ABOVE LOW BID WITH CHOSEN ALTERNATES:                      \$1,202,133.00    \$1,163,133.00    \$406,133.00                      \$1,254,133.00    \$567,133.00    \$294,133.00    \$555,133.00    \$422,133.00                      \$0.00    \$437,133.00    \$771,133.00    \$697,133.00

0                      0                      0                      0                      0                      0                      0                      0                      0                      1                      0                      0                      0

**ELECTRICAL CONTRACT BIDS**

		new                      new									
Company:		AJM Electric, Inc.	Boro	BSI Electrical Contractors	Cedar Electric	Electri-Tech Inc.	MJF Electrical Contracting, Inc.	Philips Brothers	Wind Gap Electric	M and Sons	Brandon Stanston
Base Bid:		<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$3,743,000.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$3,356,000.00</b>	<b>\$3,940,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,247,600.00</b>	<b>\$3,499,777.00</b>	<b>\$4,149,770.00</b>	<b>\$4,723,400.00</b>	<b>\$3,814,000.00</b>
Incl. ?	Alt.#	Alternate Description:									
n	#	No.1 : add classroom casework									
n	#	No.2: add classroom wall casework									
n	#		(\$39,000.00)		(\$42,250.00)	(\$52,380.00)	(\$52,000.00)	(\$52,000.00)	(\$51,000.00)	(\$34,000.00)	(\$33,705.00)
n	#		(\$75,000.00)		(\$84,500.00)	(\$111,000.00)	(\$104,000.00)	(\$104,000.00)	(\$91,000.00)	(\$68,000.00)	(\$67,410.00)
n	#	No.5A: Quartz tile in lieu Terr(2nd flr Corr)									
n	#	No.5B: Quartz tile in lieu Terr(1st flr Corr)									
n	#	No.5C: Quartz tile in lieu of Terr(café)									
n	#	No.6A:LVT in lieu of Quartz tile									
n	#	No.6B: VCT in lieu of Quartz tile									
n	#	No.7:Linear mtl clg in lieu Acoust baffles									
n	#	No.8:EPDM Roofing									
n	#	No.9:Resinous flooring in lieu ceramic									
n	#		\$10,000.00		\$5,000.00	\$44,500.00		\$5,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$16,000.00	\$10,000.00
n	#	No.11: fill within 5' (2A modified)									
n	#	No.12: ATC by Tri-m									
n	#	No.13: ATC by CM3									
n	#		\$55,000.00		\$48,000.00	\$49,800.00	\$45,000.00	\$57,000.00	\$555,000.00	\$55,800.00	\$49,900.00
n	#		\$75,000.00		\$100,000.00	\$48,000.00	\$265,000.00	\$285,000.00	\$210,000.00	\$109,000.00	\$92,500.00
n	#	No.15: Distributed Antenna System									
n	#	No.12: Bipolar Ionization									
y - Denotes chosen alternates											
<b>BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES:</b>		<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$3,743,000.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$3,356,000.00</b>	<b>\$3,940,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,247,600.00</b>	<b>\$3,499,777.00</b>	<b>\$4,149,770.00</b>	<b>\$4,723,400.00</b>	<b>\$3,814,000.00</b>

\$ ABOVE LOW BID WITH CHOSEN ALTERNATES:	\$387,000.00	\$0.00	\$584,000.00	\$1,891,600.00	\$143,777.00	\$793,770.00	\$1,367,400.00	\$458,000.00
	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0

**PLUMBING CONTRACT BIDS**

									new	new		
Company:		Dolan Mechanical, Inc	Frey Lutz	Guy M. Cooper, Inc.	Jay R. Reynolds, Inc	JBM Mechanical, Inc	Mycos Mechanical, Inc.	Stan-Roch Plumbing	Vision Mechanical, Inc.	Trefz Mechanical	5 Star	
Base Bid:		<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$2,130,000.00</b>	<b>\$1,588,800.00</b>	<b>\$1,572,000.00</b>	<b>\$1,646,000.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$1,764,900.00</b>	<b>\$1,524,067.00</b>	<b>\$2,144,000.00</b>	
Incl.?	Alt.#	Alternate Description:										
n	#	No.1 : add classroom casework										
n	#	No.2: add classroom wall casework										
n	#	No.3: Eliminate 2 classrooms										
n	#	No.4: Eliminate 4 classrooms										
n	#	No.5A: Quartz tile in lieu Terr(2nd flr Corr)										
n	#	No.5B: Quartz tile in lieu Terr(1st flr Corr)										
n	#	No.5C: Quartz tile in lieu of Terr(café)										
n	#	No.6A:LVT in lieu of Quartz tile										
n	#	No.6B: VCT in lieu of Quartz tile										
n	#	No.7:Linear mtl clg in lieu Acoust baffles										
n	#	No.8:EPDM Roofing										
n	#	No.9:Resinous flooring in lieu ceramic										
n	#	No.10:unclassified site work										
n	#	No.11: fill within 5' (2A modified)										
n	#	No.12: ATC by Tri-m										
n	#	No.13: ATC by CM3										
n	#	No.14: Lighting Protection										
n	#	No.15: Distributed Antenna System										
n	#	No.12: Bipolar Ionization										
y - Denotes chosen alternates												
<b>BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES:</b>		<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$2,130,000.00</b>	<b>\$1,588,800.00</b>	<b>\$1,572,000.00</b>	<b>\$1,646,000.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$1,764,900.00</b>	<b>\$1,524,067.00</b>	<b>\$2,144,000.00</b>	
\$ ABOVE LOW BID WITH CHOSEN ALTERNATES:				\$605,933.00	\$64,733.00	\$47,933.00	\$121,933.00		\$240,833.00	\$0.00	\$619,933.00	
		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	