
Project Name:Aronimink Elementary School

Project Number: 2513.07

GENERAL CONTRACT BIDS

Company: 
L.J. Paolella 

Construction, Inc 

John S. McManus, 

Inc.
Perrotto Builders, Ltd. ER Stuebner 

Skepton 

Construction, Inc.
Bidder's name Bidder's name Bidder's name

Base Bid: NO BID $13,287,000.00 $12,920,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Incl.? Alt.# Alternate Description:

n 1
Epoxy Resin Terrazzo in Corridors $116,000.00 $212,000.00

n 2
Quartz tile in Classrooms and SGI Rooms $80,000.00 $138,000.00

n 3
Corridor Paver Tile over Existing Glazed Block $125,000.00 $78,000.00

n 4
IG-4 Tempered Gymnasium Glazing $7,400.00 $8,000.00

n 5a
Alternate EPDM Roofing - Firestone ($7,500.00) $7,500.00

n 5b
Alternate EPDM Roofing Versico ($7,500.00) $6,500.00

n 6
Laminated Door Glazing $14,000.00 $14,000.00

n 7
Security Glazing $11,000.00 $11,000.00

n 8
Stage Operable Partition $80,000.00 $75,000.00

n 9
Art Room Furniture $12,000.00 $12,000.00

n 10
Library Furniture $80,000.00 $70,000.00

n 11
Boiler Manufacturers $0.00 n/a

n 12
Unit Ventilator Manufacturers $0.00 n/a

n 13
Flush Valves and Faucets $0.00 n/a

n 14
Lightning Protection $0.00 n/a

n 15
Cellular Distributed Antenna System $0.00 n/a

n 16
Classroom Lay-In Lighting $0.00 n/a

n 17
Unclassified site work no bid $25,000.00

n 18
Access Control Manufacturer $0.00 n/a

BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: NO BID $13,287,000.00 $12,920,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

y - Denotes chosen alternates
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Project Name:Aronimink Elementary School

Project Number: 2513.07

MECHANICAL CONTRACT BIDS

Company: 
Guy M. Cooper, 

Inc.

Five Star 

Mechanical

 JBM Mechanical, 

Inc

Myco Mechanical, 

Inc.

Framan 

Mechanical

Tri-County 

Mechanical, Inc.

General Paving & 

Asphalt
Bidder's name Bidder's name Bidder's name Bidder's name Bidder's name

Base Bid: $5,665,000.00 $4,689,000.00 $5,324,000.00 NO BID $6,674,000.00 $5,095,000.00 $7,040,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Incl.? Alt.# Alternate Description:

n 1
Epoxy Resin Terrazzo in Corridors 

n 2
Quartz tile in Classrooms and SGI Rooms

n 3
Corridor Paver Tile over Existing Glazed Block

n 4
IG-4 Tempered Gymnasium Glazing

n 5a
Alternate EPDM Roofing - Firestone

n 5b
Alternate EPDM Roofing Versico

n 6
Laminated Door Glazing 

n 7
Security Glazing

n 8
Stage Operable Partition

n 9
Art Room Furniture 

n 10
Library Furniture 

n 11
Boiler Manufacturers 

$0.00 $50,000.00 ($120,000.00) $50,000.00 $50,000.00

n 12
Unit Ventilator Manufacturers

$75,000.00 $0.00 $100,000.00 ($150,000.00)

n 13
Flush Valves and Faucets 

n 14
Lightning Protection 

n 15
Cellular Distributed Antenna System 

n 16
Classroom Lay-In Lighting

n 17
Unclassified site work

$10,000.00

n 18
Access Control Manufacturer

BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: $5,665,000.00 $4,689,000.00 $5,324,000.00 NO BID $6,674,000.00 $5,095,000.00 $7,040,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ATC Breakout Cost $970,000.00 $970,000.00 $970,000.00 $950,000.00 $970,000.00 $1,050,000.00

y - Denotes chosen alternates
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Project Name:Aronimink Elementary School

Project Number: 2513.07

ELECTRICAL CONTRACT BIDS

Company: Cedar Electric Inc. AJM Electric
Ford Brothers 

Electrical Co, Inc.

Goldhorn Electrical 

Construction 

McGoldrick Electric, 

Inc.

Philips Brothers 

Electrical
Bidder's name Bidder's name Bidder's name

Base Bid: NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,850,000.00 NO BID $5,283,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Incl.? Alt.# Alternate Description:

n 1
Epoxy Resin Terrazzo in Corridors 

n 2
Quartz tile in Classrooms and SGI Rooms

n 3
Corridor Paver Tile over Existing Glazed Block

n 4
IG-4 Tempered Gymnasium Glazing

n 5a
Alternate EPDM Roofing - Firestone

n 5b
Alternate EPDM Roofing Versico

n 6
Laminated Door Glazing 

n 7
Security Glazing

n 8
Stage Operable Partition $4,000.00

n 9
Art Room Furniture 

n 10
Library Furniture 

n 11
Boiler Manufacturers 

n 12
Unit Ventilator Manufacturers

n 13
Flush Valves and Faucets 

n 14
Lightning Protection $60,000.00 $60,000.00

n 15
Cellular Distributed Antenna System $90,000.00 $90,000.00

n 16
Classroom Lay-In Lighting ($135,000.00) ($80,000.00)

n 17
Unclassified site work $5,000.00 $7,000.00

n 18
Access Control Manufacturer $7,500.00 $2,000.00

BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,850,000.00 NO BID $5,283,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

y - Denotes chosen alternates
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Project Name:Aronimink Elementary School

Project Number: 2513.07

PLUMBING CONTRACT BIDS

Company: Guy M Cooper
 JBM Mechanical, 

Inc

Myco Mechanical, 

Inc.

Jay R. Reynolds, 

Inc.
Five Star Vision Bidder's name Bidder's name Bidder's name Bidder's name

Base Bid: $1,699,000.00 $1,624,000.00 $1,727,000.00 $1,689,300.00 $1,962,000.00 $1,806,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Incl.? Alt.# Alternate Description:

n 1
Epoxy Resin Terrazzo in Corridors 

n 2
Quartz tile in Classrooms and SGI Rooms

n 3
Corridor Paver Tile over Existing Glazed Block

n 4
IG-4 Tempered Gymnasium Glazing

n 5a
Alternate EPDM Roofing - Firestone

n 5b
Alternate EPDM Roofing Versico

n 6
Laminated Door Glazing 

n 7
Security Glazing

n 8
Stage Operable Partition

n 9
Art Room Furniture 

n 10
Library Furniture 

n 11
Boiler Manufacturers 

n 12
Unit Ventilator Manufacturers

n 13
Flush Valves and Faucets 

($13,000.00) ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) ($9,000.00) ($8,000.00) ($11,000.00)

n 14
Lightning Protection 

n 15
Cellular Distributed Antenna System 

n 16
Classroom Lay-In Lighting

n 17
Unclassified site work

$15,000.00 $19,000.00

n 18
Access Control Manufacturer

BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: $1,699,000.00 $1,624,000.00 $1,727,000.00 $1,689,300.00 $1,962,000.00 $1,806,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

y - Denotes chosen alternates
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