GENERAL CONTRACT BIDS

Company: Sketpton ER Stuebner Bidder's name Bidder's name
Base Bid: $16,165,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Incl.?|Alt.# |Alternate Description:

" | ' |Add Auxiliary Gym 163 $1,165,000.00

N | 2 |Add Green Room $81,000.00

n 3 |Deduct all Music Department Renovations ($308,000.00)

" | 43 |Deduct Quartz Tile in lieu of Terrazzo Floor ($82,000.00)

n |4 Deduct Quartz Tile in lieu of Terrazzo Floor ($57,000.00)

N | 4 |peduct Quartz Tile in lieu of Terrazzo Floor ($122,000.00)

N | 53 |EPDPM roof by Johns Manville ($6,000.00)

N | 55 |EPDM roof by Versico ($6,000.00)

N | 6 |Add Laminated Security Glazing $44,000.00

"7 NA

"8 [NnA

"% NA

n | 10 N/A

n | 11 N/A

y - Denotes chosen alternates

BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: $16,165,000.00 |[NO BID NO BID NO BID
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MECHANICAL CONTRACT BIDS

Project Name: DOWNINGTOWN HIGH SCHOOL EAST
Project Number: 2592.00

Company: Guy M Cooper Myco Vision JBM North Bay Mech McCloskey Mech Farfield Company
Base Bid: $3,375,000.00( $3,593,000.00 NO BID| $3,286,000.00f $3,514,000.00 NO BID $3,333,333.00
Incl.?|Alt.# |Alternate Description: _
n | 1 ladd Auxiliary Gym 163 $230,000.00 $234,000.00 $216,000.00 $253,000.00 $248,000.00
N | 2 |add Green Room $21,000.00 $16,000.00 $23,000.00 $22,800.00 $23,000.00
n | 3 |Deduct all Music Department Renovations ($35,000.00) ($24,000.00) ($26,000.00) ($38,000.00) ($38,000.00)
n | 4a N/A
n | 4b N/A
n | 4c N/A
n | 5a N/A
n | 5b N/A
"% [NnA
n| 7 |pgEx Piping 2" and smaller ($7,000.00) ($10,000.00) ($17,000.00) $10,000.00 $135,000.00
"8 [NnA
"% INA
n | 10 N/A
n | 11 N/A
y - Denotes chosen alternates
BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: $3,375,000.00 $3,593,000.00 |[NO BID $3,286,000.00 | $3,514,000.00 |[NO BID $3,333,333.00
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MECHANICAL CONTRACT BIDS

Company: Integrity Mech Matchline Mech Bidder's name Bidder's name
Base Bid: $3,368,500.00( $3,256,000.00 NO BID NO BID
Incl.?|Alt.# |Alternate Description:

n |1 add Auxiliary Gym 163 $192,000.00 $223,000.00

n | 2 |add Green Room $13,000.00 $21,000.00

n 3 Deduct all Music Department Renovations ($22,000.00) ($42,000.00)

n | 4a N/A

n | 4b N/A

n | 4c N/A

n | 5a N/A

n | &b N/A

"% INA

" | 7 |pPEX Piping 2" and smaller ($7,500.00) $10,000.00

"8 INA

"9 NnA

n [ 10 N/A

n 11 N/A

y - Denotes chosen alternates

BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: $3,368,500.00 $3,256,000.00 |[NO BID NO BID
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PLUMBING CONTRACT BIDS

Project Name: DOWNINGTOWN HIGH SCHOOL EAST
Project Number: 2592.00

Company: Guy M Coooper Vision JBM Tri-County Integrity Mech Jay R Reynolds Bidder's name
Base Bid: NO BID $1,724,000.00( $1,964,000.00( $1,794,000.00 NO BID| $1,739,400.00 NO BID
Incl.?|Alt.# |Alternate Description:

n | 1 ladd Auxiliary Gym 163 $55,000.00 $45,000.00 $32,000.00 $39,400.00

N | 2 |add Green Room $31,400.00 $22,000.00 $24,000.00 $37,900.00

n | 3 |Deduct all Music Department Renovations ($20,900.00) ($18,000.00) ($14,500.00) ($13,700.00)

n | 4a N/A

n | 4b N/A

n | 4c N/A

n | 5a N/A

n | 5b N/A

"% [NnA

"7 INA

"8 [NnA

"% INA

n | 10 N/A

n | 11 N/A

y - Denotes chosen alternates
BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: NO BID $1,724,000.00 $1,964,000.00 | $1,794,000.00 |[NO BID $1,739,400.00 |NO BID
J:\2592_Downingtown Area SD East— High School\10_Construction Administration\01_Bidding\230330_2592_Bid Tally_LF

KCBA Architects




ELECTRICAL CONTRACT BIDS

Project Name: DOWNINGTOWN HIGH SCHOOL EAST
Project Number: 2592.00

Company: Philips Bros AJM Electric Inc Farfield Company Hobbs & Co Bidder's name Bidder's name Bidder's name
Base Bid: $3,990,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Incl.?|Alt.# |Alternate Description:

n | 1 |add Auxiliary Gym 163 $108,000.00

N | 2 |Add Green Room $26,000.00

n 3 Deduct all Music Department Renovations ($155,000.00)

n | 4a N/A

n | 4b N/A

n | 4c N/A

n | 5a N/A

n [ 5b N/A

n % A

T OINA

N8 A

Y INA

" | 10 |Metal Clad Downstream of Panels ($20,000.00)

n 11 N/A

y - Denotes chosen alternates
BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: $3,990,000.00 |[NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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Project Name: DOWNINGTOWN HIGH SCHOOL EAST
Project Number: 2592.00

SITE CONTRACT BIDS

Company: Meco Horst Excavating Road-Con Inc Joseph Mariani Watts Svcs Foresite Concepts Corrado Bidder's name
Base Bid: NO BID| $2,055,813.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID| $2,802,823.00 NO BID
Incl.?|Alt.# |Alternate Description:

n | 1 |add Augxiliary Gym 163 ($38,156.95) ($45,910.00)

"2 |NA

"3 NA

n | 4a N/A

n | 4b N/A

n | 4c N/A

n | 5a N/A

n | 5b N/A

"% [NnA

"7 INA

"8 [NnA

"% INA

n | 10 N/A

N Imin & Overlay Existing Asphalt - Student $253,019.25 $283,246.00

y - Denotes chosen alternates

BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: NO BID $2,055,813.47 [NO BID NO BID #VALUE! NO BID $2,802,823.00 |NO BID
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