
Upper Moreland School District 

509 Davisville Road Renovations

KCBA Project No. 2361.14

June 6, 2023
GENERAL CONTRACT BIDS

Company: Walter Brucker & Co. Penn Builders Skepton Construction
TE Construction 

Services
Twining Construction Uhrig Construction

Base Bid: $1,616,720.00 $1,649,000.00 $1,793,000.00 $1,881,000.00 BID WITHDRAWN $1,980,000.00 

Incl.? Alt.# Alternate Description:

y 1
Electric Vehicle Charging Stations

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

y 2
Additional Sanitary Sewer Piping Replacement

$0.00 $12,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: $1,616,720.00 $1,661,500.00 $1,793,000.00 $1,881,000.00 BID WITHDRAWN $1,980,000.00

$ ABOVE LOW BID WITH CHOSEN ALTERNATES: $0.00 $44,780.00 $176,280.00 $264,280.00 - $363,280.00

1 0 0 0 0 0

Low Bidder: Walter Brucker & Co.

y - Denotes chosen alternates

Low Bid with Chosen Alternates: $1,616,720.00
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Upper Moreland School District

509 Davisville Road Renovations

KCBA Project No. 2361.14

June 6, 2023
MECHANICAL CONTRACT BIDS

Company: Guy M. Cooper Hirschberg Mechanical
McCloskey Mechanical 

Contractors
Myco Mechanical

Base Bid: $743,500.00 $731,425.00 NO BID $647,000.00 

Incl.? Alt.# Alternate Description:

y 1
Electric Vehicle Charging Stations

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

y 2
Additional Sanitary Sewer Piping Replacement

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: $743,500.00 $731,425.00 NO BID $647,000.00

$ ABOVE LOW BID WITH CHOSEN ALTERNATES: $96,500.00 $84,425.00 $0.00

0 0 0 1

Low Bidder: Myco Mechanical

y - Denotes chosen alternates

Low Bid with Chosen Alternates: $647,000.00
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Upper Moreland School District

509 Davisville Road Renovations

KCBA Project No. 2361.14

June 6, 2023
PLUMBING CONTRACT BIDS

Company: Guy M. Cooper Hirschberg Mechanical Myco Mechanical Vision Mechanical, Inc.

Base Bid: $255,600.00 $149,425.00 $323,000.00 $248,055.00 

Incl.? Alt.# Alternate Description:

y 1
Electric Vehicle Charging Stations

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

y 2
Additional Sanitary Sewer Replacement

$79,000.00 $44,900.00 $33,000.00 $112,460.00

BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: $334,600.00 $194,325.00 $356,000.00 $360,515.00

$ ABOVE LOW BID WITH CHOSEN ALTERNATES: $140,275.00 $0.00 $161,675.00 $166,190.00

0 1 0 0

Low Bidder: Hirschberg Mechanical

y - Denotes chosen alternates

Low Bid with Chosen Alternates: $194,325.00
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Upper Moreland School District

509 Davisville Road Renovations

KCBA Project No. 2361.14

June 6, 2023
ELECTRICAL CONTRACT BIDS

Company: Carr and Duff, Inc. Philips Brothers
S&S Electrical Services, 

Inc.

Yates Electrical Service, 

Inc.

Base Bid: $1,373,610.00 $1,424,700.00 NO BID $1,995,000.00 

Incl.? Alt.# Alternate Description:

y 1
Electric Vehicle Charging Stations

$20,000.00 $20,000.00 $15,000.00

y 2
Additional Sanitary Sewer Piping Replacement

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

BASE BID PLUS CHOSEN ALTERNATES: $1,393,610.00 $1,444,700.00 NO BID $2,010,000.00

$ ABOVE LOW BID WITH CHOSEN 

ALTERNATES: 
$0.00 $51,090.00 $616,390.00

1 0 0 0

Low Bidder: Carr and Duff, Inc.

y - Denotes chosen alternates

Low Bid with Chosen Alternates: $1,393,610.00
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